BRIGHTON & HOVE CITY COUNCIL
ROAD TRAFFIC REGULATION ACT 1984

BRIGHTON & HOVE VARIOUS CONTROLLED PARKING ZONES
CONSOLIDATION ORDER 2008 AMENDMENT ORDER No.12 2012

Brighton & Hove City Council in exercise of its powers under Sections [, 2, 3, 4, 19, 32,
35, 35A, 43, 44, 45, 46, 46A, 47, 49, 51, 53, 55, 61, 63, 63A, 66, | 17 and 124 (1) (c) & (d)
of the Road Traffic Regulation Act 1984 (“the 1984 Act”) as amended and Part 6 of the
Traffic Management Act 2004 and of all other enabling powers after consultation with the
Chief Officer of Police in accordance with Part lll of Schedule 9 to thel984 Act hereby

makes the above named Order.

The provisions of this Order will come into operation on the i day of A/OVMU 2012
and amend the Brighton & Hove Various Controlled Parking Zones Consolidation Order

2008 as amended as follows:

ARTICLE AMENDMENTS:

PART 10 - INDEX OF SCHEDULE |

Part 2 No Loading/Unloading

After existing Part 2.14 add new Part to the Index as follows:

2.15 | Monday to Sunday 7am -10am & 4pm-7pm

Paré T Na C¢n s o D e an s vl v wn g
Part 2 No Stopping Restrictions

o MAanday o Eridn
1ONd3a

S8 T iddy

[ | Entrance Markings except August

Part 7 Doctors Parking Places
Part 7.1 Doctors Parking At Any Time:
Add the letter “M” in the column headed “CPZ’s”

Part 8 Car Club Parking Places
Part 8.1 City Car Club only At Any Time:
Add the letter “A” in the column headed “CPZ’s”

Part |17 Bus Stands

Part 17.1 Mon- Sun Waiting limited 20 mins no return within | hour

Add the letter “Y” in the column headed “CPZ’s”
SCHEDULE | AMENDMENTS:

Controlled Parking Zone A
Part 8.1 City Car Club Only At Any Time

Add new item |: Hampstead Road — East side - From a point 43 metres east of the

eastern kerbline of Robertson Road eastwards for a distance of 5 metres

Part 8.2 Whizzgo Car Club Only At Any Time

Delete this Part of the Schedule in its entirety.




Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Delete item 4a: Kingsley Road, Brighton (outside No.21)

Controlled Parking Zone C
Part 8.1 City Car Club Only At Any Time
Renumber item existing item 2 Wyndham Street as item 4

Add new item 2: Devonshire Place — East side - From a point 9 metres north of the
northern kerbline of St James's Street northwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 3: William Street — West side - From a point 13.7 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Edward Street northwards for 5 metres

Part 8.2 Whizzgo Car Club Only At Any Time
Delete this Part of the Schedule in its entirety.

Part 8.3 Streetcar Car Club Only At Any Time
Delete this Part of the Schedule in its entirety.

Part 18.1 Street eligible for a Resident’s Permit
Amend item 23 Church Place: insert “Excluding No.14A” in column (3) Specific Properties
and insert “Excluding No.l4a (Car Free)” in column (4) Comments

Controlled Parking Zone H

Part 4.1 Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am - 8pm
inclusive

Delete item |58: Maresfield Road, Brighton

Mo raeti o —_ o e e 2 2 o o o gy o
- | - - e — N (] =

northern boundary of property No.82 Maresfield Road northwards for a distance of 50.1 2

metres
Delete item |59b: Maresfield Road, Brighton

Part 8.1 City Car Club Only At Any Time
Renumber existing item | Paston Place as item 2

Renumber existing item 2 St George's Road as item 3
Renumber existing item 3 Sudeley Place as item 5
Renumber existing item 4 Sussex Square as item 6
Renumber existing item 5 Walpole Terrace as item 7

Add new item |: Eastern Road — South side - From a point |3 metres east of the eastern
kerbline of Sussex Square, eastwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 4: St George’s Road — North side - From a point 4.9 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Sudeley Place eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Part 8.2 Whizzgo Car Club Only At Any Time



Delete this Part of the Schedule in its entirety.

Part 8.3 Streetcar Car Club Only At Any Time
Delete this Part of the Schedule in its entirety.

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Delete item 28a: College Terrace, Brighton (outside Nos. 16/17)

Delete item 41: Manor Road, Brighton (adjoining No.| Robin Dene)

Add new item 52b: Sussex Square — North — From a point 2.7 metres east of the
boundary wall between Nos. 22 & 23 Sussex Square eastwards for a distance of 2.7
metres (bay at an angle of 90 degrees to the kerb) (outside No.23)

Add new item 56a: Walpole Road — South side — From a point |5 metres west of the

western kerbline of Whitehawk Hill Road westwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (outside
No.44)

Delete item 80a: Maresfield Road, Brighton (outside No.88)
Delete item 84b: Prince’s Terrace, Brighton (outside No.46)

Add new item 85a: Rugby Place — West side — From a point 2 metres south of the
southern boundary of property No.23 Rugby Place northwards for a distance of 6.6
metres (opposite No.24)

Part 9.2 Disabled Badge Holders Parking from Monday to Sunday between

Yam and 6om inclusivi

Delete item 3: Sudeley Terrace, Brighton (opposite No.2)

Delete item 6: Sudeley Terrace, Brighton

Controlled Parking Zone ]
Part 4.1 Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am = 8pm

inclusive
Delete item 59: Shaftesbury Place, Brighton

Part 8.3 Streetcar Car Club Only At Any Time
Delete this Part of the Schedule in its entirety.

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time

Add new item |3a: Shaftesbury Road — East side — From a point 3 metres south of the
northern boundary of property No.94 Shaftesbury Road southwards for a distance of 6.6
metres (outside No.92)

Add new item |6a: Stanley Road — South side — From a point | metres east of the western
boundary of property No.22 Stanley Road westwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (outside
No.20)



Controlled Parking Zone M
After existing Part 6. insert new Part in the Schedule as follows:

Part 7.1 Doctors Parking At Any Time

Item

No Street Name | Side Description CPZ

From || metres south of the southern
East | kerbline of Western Road southwards for M
|| metres

Upper Market

I
Street

Part 8.1 City Car Club Only At Any Time
Renumber existing item 2 Lansdowne Place as item 4

Renumber existing item 3 Waterloo Street as item 5

Add new item 2: Holland Road — East side - From a point 2.5 metres north of the
northern boundary to the entrance to the Depository, northwards for 5.5 metres.

Add new item 3: Holland Road — East side - From a point 4 metres south of the southern
entrance to the Depository, southwards for 5.5 metres.

Part 8.3 Streetcar Car Club Only At Any Time
Delete this Part of the Schedule in its entirety.

Controlled Parking Zone N

Part 2.1 No Loading At any Time

Add new item 3: The Drive — East side — From a point 2.2 metres north of the northern
kerbline of the access to Philip Court northwards for a distance of 5 metres

inclusive

Amend item 63 Seafield Road: delete the whole description and substitute “ VWest side —
From a point opposite the property boundary of Nos. 9 & |0 Seafield Road southwards
for a distance of 5 metres”

Part 5.1 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Short Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to 2 hours, no return within 4 hours) from Monday
to Sunday between 9am to 8pm inclusive

Add new item la: Blatchington Road — South side — From a point |10 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Ventnor Villas, eastwards for a distance of 22 metres.

Part 6.1 Exclusive Low Tariff Short Term Pay & Display parking (for a period
of up to 2 hours no return within 4 hours) from Monday to Saturday between
9am and é6pm

Delete item 7: Blatchington Road, Hove

Add new item 39a: St John’s Road — South side — From a point 6 metres west of the
southern kerbline of Western Road westwards for a distance of 14 metres

Part 8.1 City Car Club Only At Any Time
Renumber existing item 4 Tisbury Road as item 6



Add new item 2a: Goldstone Villas — West side - From a point 4 metres north of the
property boundary of No.66 and 68 northwards for 5 metres.

Add new item 4: Norton Road — East side - From a point 16.5 metres north of the
northern slip road outside Hove Town Hall northwards for |1 metres

Add new item 5: Station Approach — South side - From a point 9.3 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Goldstone Villas eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Add new item 7: Wilbury Road — West side - From a point 20.6 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Church Road northwards for a distance of 5 metres

Part 8.2 Whizzgo Car Club Only At Any Time
Delete this Part of the Schedule in its entirety.

Part 8.3 Streetcar Car Club Only At Any Time
Delete this Part of the Schedule in its entirety.

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Renumber existing item 39a Goldstone Villas as item 33b

Add new item 62b: Stirling Place- North side — From a point 27.8 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Brooker Street eastwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (outside No.7)

Renumber existing item 64a Stirling Place as item 63

0D -y ==

Renumber existing item 63b The Drive (outside Copthorne Court) as item 64a

Renumber existing item 63b The Drive (outside Grove Court) as item 64¢
Renumber existing item 63 The Drive (outside No.30) as item 64d

Part 11.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time
Amend item 86 Wilbury Villas: delete “2.3 metres” and substitute “5 metres”

Amend item 88 Wilbury Villas: delete “19.7 metres” and substitute “16.2 metres” delete
“2.2 metres” and substitute “5.2 metres”

Part 14.1 Ambulance Parking Bays At Any Time
Delete item |: Seafield Road

Part 18.1 Street eligible for a Resident’s Permit

Amend item 2 Albany Villas: insert “Excluding Flats 1-12 Gilmore House Nos.|4-16 & Flats
|-12 Amber House Nos.18-20" in column (3) Specific Properties and insert “Excluding
Flats 1-12 Gilmore House Nos.14-16 & Flats 1-12 Amber House Nos.18-20 (Car Free)” in
column (4) Comments

Amend item 46 Medina Villas: delete “Excluding Nos. 35, 36, 37 & 38" in column (3)
Specific Properties and insert “Excluding Nos. 35, 36, 37 & 38 (Car Free)” in column (4)
Comments



Controlled Parking Zone O
Part 5.5 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Medium Term Pay & Display

parking (for a period of up to 4 hours, no return within 4 hours) from Monday
to Saturday between 9am and 8pm inclusive

Amend item 51 The Upper Drive: delete “a point 3 metres east of” delete “50 metres”
and substitute “47 metres”

Part 8.1 City Car Club Only At Any Time
Renumber existing item | Montefiore Road as item 2

Add new item |: Caburn Road — East side - From a point 6 metres north of the northern
kerbline of Highdown Road northwards for 5 metres.

Add new item 3: York Avenue — West side - From a point 8 metres south of the southern
kerbline of Furze Hill southwards for 5 metres.

Part 8.2 Whizzgo Car Club Only At Any Time
Delete this Part of the Schedule in its entirety.

Part 8.3 Streetcar Car Club Only At Any Time
Delete this Part of the Schedule in its entirety.

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Delete item 7a: Byron Street, Hove (outside No.70)

enumber existung item o Cromwell Road, Hove (outside No.38B) as item 8¢

Delete item 63b The Drive, Hove (outside No.64)
Delete item 87a: Sheridan Terrace, Hove (outside Nos. 24/26)

Part 11.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time
Add new item 45a: The Upper Drive — South side — From the eastern boundary of No.66
The Upper Drive eastwards for a distance of 3 metres

Add new item 57: Wilbury Villas — West side — From a point 1.5 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Cambridge Grove access road northwards for a distance of 3 metres

Add new item 58: Wilbury Villas — VWest — From a point |.5 metres north of the common
boundary of Nos. 30 & 32 Wilbury Villas northwards for a distance of 2.5 metres

Controlled Parking Zone Q

Part 5.7 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Long Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to |1 hours) fromm Monday to Sunday between 9am
and 8pm inclusive

Renumber existing item | Stanford Road as item 6

Renumber existing item 2 Stanford Road as item 7



Controlled Parking Zone R
Part |.1 No Waiting At Any Time

Delete and reinstate item 64: Westbourne Gardens, Hove

Part 3.1 No Stopping on School Entrance Marking Monday to Friday 8am-6pm
except August

Delete item |: VWestbourne Gardens

After existing Part 3.1 insert new Part in the Schedule as follows:
Part 3.3 No Stopping on School Entrance Markings Monday to Friday 8am -
9am and 3pm - épm except August

distance of 25.5 metres.

:::Izm Street Name | Side Description CPZ
St Christopher's School. From a point 16.5
| Westbourne East metres north of the northern kerb line of R
Gardens e New Church Road, northwards for a

Part 5.4 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Medium Term Pay & Display

parking (for a period of up to 4 hours, no return within 4 hours) from Monday
to Sunday between 9am -8pm inclusive
Amend item 65a Westbourne Villas: delete “55.7 metres” and substitute “50.1 metres”

Part 8.1 City Car Club Only At Any Time

Delete item 2: Langdale Road, Hove

Add new item 2: Westbourne Gardens — East side - From a point 42 metres north of the

Part 8.2 Whizzgo Car Club Only At Any Time

Delete this Part of the Schedule in its entirety.

Part 9.1

Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Delete item 2: Arthur Street, Hove (outside No.6)

Add new item 7a: Byron Street — South side- From the east boundary wall of No.70
Byron Street westwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (outside No.70)

Delete item |6: Kingsway, Hove (outside No.[59)

Delete item 49: Payne Avenue, Hove (outside No.89)

Delete item 51: Payne Avenue, Hove (outside No.24)

Delete item 61: Poynter Road, Hove (outside No.|6)

Delete item 66: Richardson Road, Hove (outside Nos. |16/18)

Delete item 69a: Rutland Gardens, Hove (outside No.53)

Delete item 108: Wordsworth Street, Hove (outside No.| 18)




Add new item 87a: Sheridan Terrace — North side — From a point 6 metres east of the
eastern boundary wall of No.|18 Sheridan Terrace eastwards for a distance of 6 metres
(outside Nos. 24/26)

Part 12.13 Loading Only from Monday to Sunday 9am to 8pm
Amend item | Coleridge Street: delete “8 metres” and substitute “5 metres” delete “7.6
metres” and substitute “7.8 metres”

Part 14.1 Ambulance Parking Bays At Any Time
Add item 3: Westbourne Villas — West side — From a point 56.6 metres south of the
southern kerbline of New Church Road southwards for a distance of 12.6 metres

Controlled Parking Zone U
Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time

Add new item 6a: St Luke’s Road — East side — From a point 20 metres south of the

southern kerbline of Freshfield Road southwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (outside
Nos. 17 & 19)

Controlled Parking Zone Y
After existing Part 2.5 insert new Part in the Schedule as follows:
Part 2.15 No Loading Monday to Sunday 7am - |0am and 4pm - 7pm

Item

No Street Name | Side Description CPZ
Queens Place
I (East/West Both | Entire Length Y
section)
Amend item |23 Tidy Street: delete "no., 21/22" and substitute "nos. 22/21

Part 5.18 Shared Permit Holders and High Tariff Short Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to 2 hours no return within 4 hours) from Monday
to Sunday between 9am to 8pm inclusive

Amend item || Ditchling Road: delete “From a point opposite” and substitute “From a
point |16.6 metres south and opposite

Part 8.1 City Car Club Only At Any Time
Add new item |b: Guildford Road — South side - From a point 10 metres west of the
western kerbline of Surrey Street westwards for 10 metres.

Add new item |lc: Leopold Road — South side - From a point 27.2 metres west of the
western kerbline of Buckingham Road westwards for a distance of 5.5 metres.

Add new item 2a: Montpelier Crescent — West side - From a point 30.4 metres south of
the southern kerbline of Vernon Terrace southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Part 8.2 Whizzgo Car Club Only At Any Time
Delete this Part of the Schedule in its entirety.

Part 8.3 Streetcar Car Club Only At Any Time
Delete this Part of the Schedule in its entirety.



Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time

Add new item |2a: Ditchling Road — East side — From a point opposite the boundary of
Nos. 43/45 Ditchling Road southwards for a distance of 6.6 metres

Renumber existing item 20a London Road as item 20b

Add new item 20a: Lewes Road — West side — From a point 8.5 metres south and
opposite the southern property boundary of No.l | Richmond Terrace southwards for a
distance of 2.6 metres (4.5 metres wide at an angle of 90 degrees to the kerb).

Delete item 33: Stroudley Road, Brighton

Delete item 34: Stroudley Road, Brighton

Delete item 35: Stroudley Road, Brighton

Delete item 44: Vernon Terrace, Brighton (outside No.29)

Part 11.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time
Delete item 29: Richmond Terrace

Add new item |9a: Lewes Road — West side — From a point 3 metres north and opposite
the southern property boundary of No.l | Richmond Terrace southwards for a distance of

I 1.5 metres

Part 12.11 Loading Only Monday - Sunday 9am to 6pm

iten Ditchline
ol 11U metres

After existing Part 14.1 insert new Part in the Schedule as follows:
Part 17.1 Bus Stand Waiting Limited to 20 minutes no return within | hour

Item

No Street Name | Side Description CPZ

From a point 3.3 metres south of the
prolongation of the southern kerbline of
Brunswick Row southwards for a distance
26.8 metres

Ditchling Road East

Controlled Parking Zone Z
Part 2.1 No Loading At any Time
Amend item 7b East Street: delete “Kings Place” and substitute “Kings Road”

Amend item 2| Pavilion Parade: delete “a point 45 metres south of the southern kerbline”
and substitute “the northern kerbline ”

Add new item 42: Windsor Street — West side — From the southern kerbline of Church
Street southwards for a distance of |15 metres

Add new item 43: Windsor Street — East side — From the southern kerbline of Church
Street southwards for a distance of |5 metres



Part 4.1 Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am -8pm
inclusive

Amend item 99 Sillwood Street: delete *“10 metres” and substitute “13 metres” delete “52
metres” and substitute “49 metres”

Part 9.4 Disabled Badge Holders Parking Places Maximum Length of Stay 3
hours no return within | hour
Renumber existing item 2 New Road as item 3

Delete item 19: Palace Place, Brighton (opposite No.2)

Part 11.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time
Delete item 27: Sillwood Road, Brighton

Add new item 27b: Sillwood Street — South side — From a point 10 metres west of the
western kerbline of Little Preston Street westwards for a distance of 3 metres

THE COMMON SEAL OF BRIGHTON & HOVE )
CITY COUNCIL was affixed hereto this 25" day of )
etober Two Thousand and Twelve )
in the presence of

10



